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ANDRÉ BRUNEL CHÂTEAUNEUF-DU-PAPE
LES CAILLOUX ROUGE

CHÂTEAUNEUF-DU-PAPE, RHÔNE VALLEY,
FRANCE

92
POINTS

“Always one of the more garrigue-scented
Châteauneufs, the Brunels' 2018 Châteauneuf
du Pape includes hints of lavender and bay leaf
on the nose, alongside ripe cherries and hints
of plum, cola and mocha. It's medium to full-
bodied, silky-textured and elegant, with no
rough edges at all, so it goes down easily, even
at this young age. I'd opt for drinking it over
the next decade.”

AUGUST, 2020

©2025 IMPORTED BY QUINTESSENTIAL, NAPA CA

2018

ANDRÉ BRUNEL CHÂTEAUNEUF-DU-PAPE
LES CAILLOUX ROUGE

CHÂTEAUNEUF-DU-PAPE, RHÔNE VALLEY,
FRANCE

92
POINTS

“Always one of the more garrigue-scented
Châteauneufs, the Brunels' 2018 Châteauneuf
du Pape includes hints of lavender and bay leaf
on the nose, alongside ripe cherries and hints
of plum, cola and mocha. It's medium to full-
bodied, silky-textured and elegant, with no
rough edges at all, so it goes down easily, even
at this young age. I'd opt for drinking it over
the next decade.”

AUGUST, 2020

©2025 IMPORTED BY QUINTESSENTIAL, NAPA CA

2018

ANDRÉ BRUNEL CHÂTEAUNEUF-DU-PAPE
LES CAILLOUX ROUGE

CHÂTEAUNEUF-DU-PAPE, RHÔNE VALLEY,
FRANCE

92
POINTS

“Always one of the more garrigue-scented
Châteauneufs, the Brunels' 2018 Châteauneuf
du Pape includes hints of lavender and bay leaf
on the nose, alongside ripe cherries and hints
of plum, cola and mocha. It's medium to full-
bodied, silky-textured and elegant, with no
rough edges at all, so it goes down easily, even
at this young age. I'd opt for drinking it over
the next decade.”

AUGUST, 2020

©2025 IMPORTED BY QUINTESSENTIAL, NAPA CA

2018

ANDRÉ BRUNEL CHÂTEAUNEUF-DU-PAPE
LES CAILLOUX ROUGE

CHÂTEAUNEUF-DU-PAPE, RHÔNE VALLEY,
FRANCE

92
POINTS

“Always one of the more garrigue-scented
Châteauneufs, the Brunels' 2018 Châteauneuf
du Pape includes hints of lavender and bay leaf
on the nose, alongside ripe cherries and hints
of plum, cola and mocha. It's medium to full-
bodied, silky-textured and elegant, with no
rough edges at all, so it goes down easily, even
at this young age. I'd opt for drinking it over
the next decade.”

AUGUST, 2020


